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Rel)resentalion ol Ille Sacramento Valley Railroad by Artist, George Malhis. 

THE SACRAMENTO 

VALLEY RAILROAD 

California's first railroad, the Sacramento Valley 
Railroad (SVRR), was incorporated on August 16, 
1852. The line was surveyed by Theodore Judah, who 
went on to greater fame as the surveyor of the Central 
Pacific's Sierra route. The original line was 22.9 miles 
long and was laid to a gauge of five feet. Although the 
line was opened to Folsom on January l ,  1856, the 
fonnal opening celebration di"d not occur until Feb­
ruary 22. l856. In 1859, SVRR built a twelve mile 
branch from Perkins Station to the Sacramento River, 
known loeall y as the Freeport Railroad. Later, this 
branch was abandoned by the Central Pacific Rail-

road, which bad purchased the SVRR on August 16, 
1865. Also in 1865, the sizeable shops of the Sac­
ramento Valley Railroad were dismantled by the Cen­
tral Pacific and moved to Sacramento and the line was 
relaid to standard 4' 8½ 11 gauge. 

The western te.rminus of the SVRR was at Second 
and R Streets in Sacrnmento. Much of Lhe line is still 
in existence today. Beginning al the tenninus, the line 
goes east up R Street and joins the Southern Pacific's 
main valley line to Stockton at Brighton, under the 
U.S. Highway 50 Bridge. Beyond Brighton, the line, 
known as the Southern Pacific's Placerville Branch, 
parallels Folsom Boulevard to Folsom, California. A 
plaque on the comer of the warehouse south of the 
tracks at Third and R Streets commemorates tbis rail­
road. 
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Alnerican Society of Civil Engineers 
Sacran1ento Section 

Local Historic Civil Engineering Landmark 

Sacramento Valley Railroad 

Sacramento Valley Railroad (1852-1877) 

Sacramento Valley Railroad "First in the 
West" 
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